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STATE OF FLORIDA
STATE OF FLORIDA )

COUNTY OF .- Leon )

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 215.26, or Section * Florida Statutes, I

hereby apply for a refund and request that a State Warrant be drawn in favor of:

NAME : Gardinier, Inc. _

ADDRESS: 8813 Highway 41 South

Riverview, Florida 33569

which represents moneys I paid into the State Treasury subject to refund, and to substesntiate such claim the
following facts are submitted:

Reason for Claim: Overpayment of processing fees, AC 29~177929 - $500; AC 29-177930Q - 4500
AC 29-177931 - $2,500. Receipt # 151109 '

" CERTIFIED TRUE AND CORRECT this day of , 19 .

Signature

*Must be completed if authority is other than Section 215.26, Florida Statutes.
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(FOR AGENCY USE ONLY)

(1) Agency recommends denisl of above claim based on the following facts, including statutory authority for
collection: :

or

(2) Agency recommends approval of above claim and submits the following information to substentiate such claim.
The amount recommended: ’ . . he

The amount requestédvabove was originally deposited into the Stete Treasury, included in Stete Treasurer's
Receipt # , dated .

NAME OF ACCOUNT:

HSAMAS Accoum CODERS:
I Y I I

Statutory Authority for Collection
It is requested that payment be mede from:

NAME OF ACCOUNT:

| S T O I

CERTIFIED TRUE AND CORRECT this 11 day of June , 19.90 .

Dept. of Environmental Regulatio

. Aggncy 2§q-—’(—’//1//Wk -
—\\\\. Signature of Authorized Person

Chiefr, Bureau of Air Regulation
Title
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SECTION 215.26 STATES, IN PART: "APPLICATION FOR REFUNDS AS PROVIDED BY THIS SECTION SHALL BE FILED WITH THE
COMPTROLLER, EXCEPT AS OTHERWISE' PROVIDED HEREIN, WITHIN 3 YEARS AFTER THE RIGHT T0 SUCH REFUND SHALL HAVE
ACCRUED ELSE SUCH RIGHT SHALL BE.BARRED." Three years is interpreted as meaning three years from the date of

payment into the State Treasury.
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Florida Department of Environmental Regulation
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Bob Martinez, Governor Dale Twachtmann, Secretary John Shearer, Assistant Secretary

May 18, 1990

CERTIFIED MAIL - RETURN RECEIPT REQUESTED

Mr. E. O. Morris
Environmental Manager
Gardinier, Inc.

8813 Hwy 41 South
Riverview, Florida 33569

Dear Mr. Morris:

Re: Construction Permit Applications for No. 3 and 4 AP
Granulators and South AP Cooler (AC 29-177929, 30, 31).

The above construction permit applications can be handled by the

Department's Southwest District and the Environmertal Protection

Commission of Hillsborouglr County by modifying the current
operating permits as there is no construction permit to amend.

Since there will be no increase in actual emissions, the current

operating rates can be amended by letter without issuing now

permits. Please resubmit your request to those respective

offices. A refund of your permit aprlication fees is being

forwarded separately.

Sincerely,

Bureau of Air Regulatlion
CHF/JR/plm
c: W. Thomas, SW District

J. Campbell, EPCHC
D. Buff, XBN



State of Florida
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i DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL REGULATION
For Rowting To Other Than The Addressse '
b. Locstion:
Yo: Locanon:
\Q\\ % Locavon:
\'\ From: Dese:
AN
i ;
To: NY "
° N2
From: David M. Beebe, Assistant Chief ))
Bureau of Finance and Accounting
Date: K- 23-920
- Subject: Refund .of Fées : : C— - e
Your application for refund for Mm&_ﬂm}\Qj\/ \\ L
Filef QGQQ~\,\WQq-)'_HC?%OAH\TQS‘IS complete. :
State of Florida Warrant ‘\[&O@]&S(@ ‘ , dated (/)-60~qb and
in the amount of $ 2. 500.0¢) , was mailed T\-S-97)
7

DMB/1s

Refund processed on Agency.Voucherv OOﬁQ\O&S
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