Rick Scott

Florida Department of Governor
Environmental Protection st Carol

Marjory Stoneman Douglas Building
3900 Commonwealth Boulevard
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3000

Herschel T. Vinyard Jr.
Secretary

- July 22,2011

Spartan Cleaners of the Palm Beaches, Inc.
5500 S Dixie Hwy
W. Palm Beach, FL 33405

Your check # 3751 is being returned to you for the following reason:

Not Signed. Please sign check and return package to:
FDEP, P.O. Box 3070, Tallahassee, FL. 32315 .

Wrohg Payee

X' Your Air Permit Fée-is not d‘ue at this time.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (850) 245-2456.

Sincerely,

Jennifer Peddicord -
Finance and Accounting Director Il
Bureau of Finance and Accounting

Jp/bb

cc: Reading File
Cashier _
Dickson Dibble

www.dep.state. fl.us



Grant, Patricia

From: Dibble, Dickson

Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2011 3:54 PM
To: Grant, Patricia :

Cc: Arif, Syed; Pacione, Michael

Subject: FW: Returned Check

Attachments: Spartan.pdf

Pat,

For the record, would you be so kind to print out this email, including the attached pdf document and file allunder the
following: '

ID# 0990487-003-AG

SPARTAN CLEANERS OF THE PALM BEACHES INC
5500 S Dixie Hwy

WEST PALM BEACH, FL 33405

Thank you and have a great evening.

&0

Dickson E. Dibble, ES III

Air General Permit Program ‘
FDEP Division of Air Resource Management
Office of Permitting & Compliance

Minerals & Metals Section

Tel. (850) 717-9071

FAX (850) 717-9001

GIC - #59571
Dickson.Dibble@dep.state.fl.us

f&omumcmr—:

in plain language

Piease note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from state officials regarding
state business are public records available to the public and media upon request. Your e-mail communications may
therefore be subject to public disclosure

From: Brown, Benjamin L.

Sent: Friday, July 22, 2011 3:13 PM
To: Dibble, Dickson

Subject: Returned Check

The attached letter is for your records.
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Department of
- Environmental Protection

' Division of Air Resource Management
Jeb Bush 2600 Blair Stone Road, MS 5510 Colleen M. Castille
Governor Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400 Secretary

TO: Holder of Title V Air General Permit

Our records indicate that, as the owner or operator of an eligible facility, you have claimed entitlement to
the use of a Title V Air General Permit under Rule 62-213.300, Florida Administrative Code (F.A.C.).

For your facility to maintain its eligibility for the Title V Air General Permit, Rule 62-213,300(3)(b),
F.A.C. states "...the owner or operator of the facility must, upon written notice from the Department,
submit payment of an annual operation fee in the amount of $50.00. This fee is due and payable between
January 15 and March 1 of each year for which the facility is in operation and subject to the
requirements of this rule and the general permit." This invoice constitutes the Department's written
notice, as required under the general permit rule.

Please make your check or money order payable to the Department of Environmental Protection and
staple it to the detachable portion of this invoice below. To maintain your facility's eligibility for the
general permit, the fee must be received by the Department not later than March 1. Your check and the
detachable portion of this invoice below should be mailed to:

Title V Air General Permits
Receipts
Post Office Box 3070
Tallahassee, FL 32315-3070

(CUT HERE)

THIS PORTION MUST BE ATTACHED TO REMITTANCE FOR PROPER HANDLING

Please include your AIRS ID# on your check or money order. This number is located on the mailing label.

| TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $50.00

FLAIR ACCT. CODE 372020350013755010000
BENIFITTING OBJECT CODE 002000

Do NOT Remove Label BENIFITTING CATEGORY 000200

(AIRS ID# 990487 d
| SPARTAN CLEANERS OF TH
i FOR GOVERNMENT USE ONLY
PALM BEACHES INC ] ORG.: 37550101000 EO: Al
5500 S Dixie Hwy FUND: 20-2-035001
WEST PALM BEACH, FLORIDA OBJECT: 002273

Printed on recycled paper.




CRAIG U. KAHLE CPA PA
Certified Public Accountant
1501 Presidential Way - Suite 16
West Palm Beach, FL 33401
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TITLE V - General Permit
Receipts

Post Office Box 3070
Tallahassee, FL 32315-3070
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